BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F: (601) 859-4743

DATE: November 12, 2014
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammack
Emergency Management Office
RE: Road Claim
Kim Layton
Cedar Hill Rd.

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the
Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of Kim Layton in
the amount of $97.00 for stated repairs. If any further information is needed, please contact
our office.

Reported area was not repaired within the 7 day period allotted per Madison County Road
Claim Policy.



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

Personal

Information

Date: kB -50- \L\
Name: "%\W\ V—Q/U\"\@Q
%\D \Wﬁf% Pou\i o
Covndon. ™S 29016
comac s OB Y413 (001-859-960Y
Make/ Model of Vehicle: 201 & ’Y&J\& & ODVD L(&

Incident

Information

Please answer questlons below in relatlons to the 1nc1dent bemg
reported: ‘

Date: lO ?,LO ‘Ll .+ Time: IYOD
Location: @'{dw H/l (/(
(name of road incident occurred) 6\&01’\‘,(/\@(\ W
Area Landmarks: \ \Q%( Ll\% \Mfc
Approx. Speed at time of incident: 35 ‘qo W\p(f\
Direction of Travel: HOV"’V\

Cause of Incident: PO‘\' %@‘ Q,

(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)

Area of vehicle damaged: S\’VOV\"/ D@&Qﬂq@( r( IN

Incident

Summary

Please write a brief summary of the incident (use back if needed):

it o pot ol ond e
43(\\;9 e O Ay

Vi

&mw VSN naeded  2nd &m.@

0 3\/(4— QoA lmnn

&>

(v

A -
Dept +o R85t Npak Stotu-——

%o’@

31114 - Second
[1a —emoole

[
\& /1D

Date Received: \0\\®\\\k

/%’55155 ONLY:
Received by: )(/\ Dept: %
G



TERMIHAL 10, 60010601
HERCHAHT #: 000000019341187
UIsA

ECCRREROS454 EXP: 4/ ik SHIPED
SALE

BATCH: 000543 IHU: BBBea7
Oct 38. 14 15:38

RRIt: 000021807839 AUTH: BAS5158

KIHBERLY D LAVION
PHOHE #(6B1) 859-2432

SECURITY FOR THIS
TRANSACTION POWERED BY
RETRIEVER OF JACKSOH

CUSTOHER COPY



Atk 0 INVOICE # JA921106
865 BOLING STREET Invoice

JACKSON, MS 39209 LOCATION 127
Phone 601-948-8222 DATE 10/30/14 15:38:36
An LKQ Company
BILL TO SHIP TO
|/284881 _-| [‘()410 CASH SALE _—|
0410 CASH SALE 865 BOLING ST
0410 CASH SALE JACKSON, MS 39209-2614
865 BOLING ST 601-948-8222
JACKSON, MS 39209-2614
601-948-8222
| ORDER NUMBER | ORDER DATE | SALES REP CUSTOMER P/O NUMBER PAYMENT TERMS
JAE22207 10/30/14 L219/L020 CREDIT CARD (GLOBAL GATEW
SHIP DATE |WRTN BY [ CONTACT R/O NUMBER SHIP VIA
10/30/14| OF9F i ) CUSTOMER PICKUP

For Questions, contact CARL TAYLOR, 601-863-0562, JACKSON, MS

STL69543A45N 1 1 0 113.79 70.00 EA 70.00 *
WL;03-14CRLA/MTRX;16X6.5;16RND _ J-30-19-03
“ BLK/VALVE STEM INLINE W VNT/LG o ) B o e T
VISA XXXXXXXXXXXX5454 75.60

——AUTH-NO-083075—AV-S-NULI
TRAN TYPE PRE-AUTHORIZATION

NAME: 127 H\

SIGNATURE X @/
| AGREE TO PAY ABOVE TOTAL AMOUNT OF

EACH CHARGE LISTED ACCORDING TO CARD 0/
ISSUER AGREEMENT _

(MERCHANT AGREEMENT IF CREDIT VOUCHER) - \

All payments are due in full in accordance with the payment terms stated herein. Balances not paid by the due date
are subject to a late payment fee of the greater of (i) 2% per month compounded monthly (26.8% per year) or (ii)
$5.00. In addition the customer is responsible for all costs of collection, including reasonable attorneys' fees

and other fees incurred in the collection process. If the foregoing charges exceed the rate that may be lawfully
charged, then such charges shall be calculated at the highest lawful rate.

CURRENT TAX RATE FOR THIS INVOICE: 8.000 %

MERCHANDISE HANDLING | MISC CHARGE TAX FREIGHT DEPOSIT DEPOSIT
TOTAL AMOUNT APPLIED
70.00 0.00 0.00 5.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 75.60
Received By:

30-Day Return Palicy - The original sales receipt must accompany all returns. Returns without the original sales receipt will not be accepted. A part returned undamaged within 30 days of the
original purchase date may be credited at management's discretion, but no credit will be given for any part returned more than 30 days after the original purchase date. Core charges are refundable
if the appropriate core is returned within 30 days. No returns will be accepted after 30 days. .

Refund Policy - Cash Purchases returned on the same day as delivered will be refunded by your local branch. All other refunds will be processed by Keystone Automotive Industries’ corporate

office and sent via U.S. mail within seven (7) working days.
CUSTOMER COPY
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 4:33 PM

To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown'

Cc: Michael Gober (Michael.Gober@madison-co.com)
Subject: Follow up on claim

I wanted to follow up on claim for Cedar Hill Rd. Have any repairs been made since 10/30?

Jennifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Friday, October 31, 2014 2:16 PM
To: Helen Keller

Subject: Road CLaim

I have a new road claim on Cedar Hill Rd. Pothole reported in area of Demascus Church (residential
side). The 7 day period date will be Nov. 7. Please update me of any repairs made between now and then.

Jewnifer Carpenter
Administrative Assistant
Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration
0: 601-855-5620
C: 601-259-2260



